BID TABULATION FOR WATER MAIN EQUIPMENT

Buyer: Lance Wright
Page 1 of 2

ITEM NO. DESRIPTION

1" Trash Pump

2" Trash Pump

3" Trash Pump

Rock Drill

Pneumatic Grinder W/guard
3" Piercing Tool

4" Piercing Tool
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Multi-Purpose Saw
Walk-Behind Saw

1000W Portable Generator
Estimated Totals
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Special Notes or Conditions
Payment Terms
Shipping Terms

ITEM NO. DESRIPTION

1" Trash Pump

2" Trash Pump

3" Trash Pump

Rock Drill

Pneumatic Grinder W/guard
3" Piercing Tool

4" Piercing Tool
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Multi-Purpose Saw
Walk-Behind Saw

1000W Portable Generator
Estimated Totals
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Special Notes or Conditions
Payment Terms
Shipping Terms

BID NO. 09-0249

Ventilation Blower with Accessories Electric

Ventilation Blower with Accessories Electric

BID OPENING DATE: 11/19/09

CONTRACTOR NAME & UNIT PRICES

Estimated Barco Pump
Quantity Dallas, TX 75207

16 Each
4 Each
12 Each
13 Each
12 Each
2 Each
1 Each
3 Each
28 Each
7 Each
7 Each

Unit Price  Total
$339.00 $5,424.00
$599.38 $2,397.52
$647.79 $7,773.48
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00

$15,595.00

1% 10 Days

Net 30

F.O.B

United Rentals
Fort Worth, TX 76104

CONTRACTOR NAME & UNIT PRICES

Estimated T.T. Technologies, Inc.
Quantity Aurira, IL 60502

16 Each
4 Each
12 Each
13 Each
12 Each
2 Each
1 Each
3 Each
28 Each
7 Each
7 Each

Unit Price  Total
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
$4,675.00 $9,350.00
$5,450.00 $5,450.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
$14,800.00
3to 5 Days
Net 30
F.O.B

Unit Price Total
$355.95 $5,695.20
$1,023.86 $4,095.44
$1,253.11 $15,037.32
$1,233.82 $16,039.66
$1,165.59 $13,987.08
$5,734.19 $11,468.38
$7,046.55 $7,046.55
$746.73 $2,240.19
$832.14 $23,299.92
$2,033.13 $14,231.91
$713.09 $4,991.63
$118,133.28
Not Specified
Net 30
F.0.B
ARAMSCO, Inc.

Dallas, Texas 75247

Unit Price Total
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
No Bid $0.00
$1,850.00 $12,950.00
No Bid $0.00
$12,950.00
5 Days
Net 30
F.O.B

Sunbelt Rentals
Fort Worth, TX 76111

Unit Price
$335.00

No Bid

No Bid
$1,195.00
$1,095.00
$4,805.00
$5,675.00
$880.00
$740.00

$2,250.00

$660.00

Not Specified
Net 30
F.0.B

Total

$5,360.00
$0.00
$0.00
$15,535.00
$13,140.00
$9,610.00
$5,675.00
$2,640.00
$20,720.00
$15,750.00
$4,620.00
$93,050.00

Six & Mango Equipment LLP

Grand Prairie,

Unit Price
$349.00
$960.00

$1,157.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$825.00

No Bid
$679.00

14 Days
Net 30
F.0.B

Texas 75050

Total

$5,584.00
$3,840.00
$13,884.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$23,100.00
$0.00
$4,753.00
$51,161.00

Kirby-Smith Machinery
Fort Worth, Texas 76106

Unit Price
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$869.50
No Bid
No Bid

30 Days
Net 30
F.0.B

Total
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$24,346.00
$0.00
$0.00
$24,346.00

Kinloch Equipment
Arlington, Texas 76011

Unit Price
$389.00
$1,220.29
$1,479.40
$1,389.89
$645.53
$6,162.00
$7,260.00
$351.56
$1,017.20
$1,929.79
$668.00

Not Specified
Net 30
F.O.B

Total
$6,224.00
$4,881.16

$17,752.74
$18,068.57
$7,746.36
$12,324.00
$7,260.00
$1,054.68
$28,481.60
$13,508.53
$4,676.00
$121,977.64




\ BID TABULATION FOR WATER MAIN EQUIPMENT \
Buyer: Lance Wright BID NO. 09-0249 BID OPENING DATE: 11/19/09
Page 2 of 2 CONTRACT‘OR NAME & UNIT PRICES
ITEM NO. DESRIPTION Estimated |Austin Pump & Supply Co. Hilti, Inc.
Quantity Haltom, Texas 76117 Tulsa, Oklahoma 74146
Unit Price  Total Unit Price |Total
1 1" Trash Pump 16 Each $533.00 $8,528.00 No Bid $0.00
2 2" Trash Pump 4 Each $767.00 $3,068.00 No Bid $0.00
3 3" Trash Pump 12 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
4 Rock Drill | 13 Each No Bid $0.00 | NoBid $0.00
5 Pneumatic Grinder W/guard 12 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
6 3" Piercing Tool 2 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
7 4" Piercing Tool 1 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
8 Ventilation Blower with Accessories Electric 3 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
9 Multi-Purpose Saw 28 Each No Bid $0.00 $890.00 | $24,920.00
10 Walk-Behind Saw 7 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
11 1000W Portable Generator 7 Each No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Estimated‘ Totals $11,596.00 $24,920.00
Special Notes or Conditions 3 Weeks 3to 5 Days
Payment Terms 2% 30 Days/ Net 31 Net 30
Shipping "I'erms F.O.B F.O.B




